
      
VIRGINIA BOARD OF NURSING AND  

COMMITTEE OF THE JOINT BOARDS OF NURSING AND MEDICINE 
   AGENCY SUBORDINATE  

INFORMAL CONFERENCE 
November 4, 2024 

 
TIME AND PLACE:    The informal conference held before an Agency Subordinate of the Board of 

Nursing was convened at 9:00 A.M., on November 4, 2024, in Hearing Room 5, 
Department of Health Professions, 9960 Mayland Drive, Suite 201, Henrico, 
Virginia. 

  AGENCY  
  SUBORDINATE:    Patricia Selig, Ph.D., R.N., F.N.P.     
   
  STAFF PRESENT:             Robin Hills, D.N.P., R.N., W.H.N.P.-B.C. 
              Deputy Executive Director for Advanced Practice                
      
OTHERS PRESENT Christine Andreoli, Senior Adjudication Specialist, Administrative  

Proceedings Division 
    Jovonni Armstead, Adjudication Specialist, Administrative Proceedings Division 
    Melissa Gray, Adjudication Specialist, Administrative Proceedings Division 
    Scott Pearl, Adjudication Specialist, Administrative Proceedings Division 
    Lesley Smith, Adjudication Specialist, Administrative Proceedings Division 
    Aaron Timberlake, Adjudication Specialist, Administrative Proceedings Division 
    Davis Wilcox, Virginia Department of Environmental Quality 
     

 
CONFERENCE  
SCHEDULED:  Amanda Bandzwolek, RN     0028-000565 

Ms. Bandzwolek did not appear. 
 

Based upon information provided by Ms. Gray, Dr. Selig ruled that adequate 
notice was provided to Ms. Wiles.  
 
A recommended decision will be mailed to Ms. Bandzwolek within ninety days. 
 
This recommendation will be presented to the full Board; if accepted, an Order 
will be entered.  As provided by law, this decision shall become a Final Order 
thirty days after service of such order on Ms. Bandzwolek unless a written 
request to the Board for a formal hearing on the allegations made against him is 
received from Ms. Bandzwolek within such time. If service of the order is made 
by mail, three additional days shall be added to that period. Upon such timely 
request for a formal hearing. 

 
CONFERENCE  
SCHEDULED:  Clarice Barrington, RN    0001-213146 

Ms. Barrington appeared. 
 
Ms. Barrington was informed a recommended decision will be made and mailed 
to her within ninety days. 
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This recommendation will be presented to the Board; if accepted, an Order will 
be entered. As provided by law, this decision shall become a Final Order thirty 
days after service of such order on Ms. Barrington unless a written request to the 
Board for a formal hearing on the allegations made against her is received from 
Ms. Barrington within such time. If service of the order is made by mail, three 
additional days shall be added to that period. Upon such timely request for a 
formal hearing, the Order shall be vacated. 
 

CONFERENCE  
SCHEDULED:  Ronica Williams, APRN    0024-179698 

Ms. Williams appeared, represented by her attorney, Nora Ciancio. 
 
Ms. Williams was informed a recommended decision will be made and mailed 
to her within ninety days. 
 
This recommendation will be presented to the Full Committee; if accepted, an 
Order will be entered. As provided by law, this decision shall become a Final 
Order thirty days after service of such order on Ms. Williams unless a written 
request to the Committee for a formal hearing on the allegations made against 
her is received from Ms. Williams within such time. If service of the order is 
made by mail, three additional days shall be added to that period. Upon such 
timely request for a formal hearing, the Order shall be vacated 
 

RECESS:    The Informal Conference recessed at 12:30 P.M.  
 
RECOVENTION:              The Informal Conference reconvened at 1:18 P.M. 

 
CONFERENCE  
SCHEDULED:  Chiquita Collins, APRN     0024-181629 

Ms. Collins appeared, represented by her attorney, Nora Ciancio, and 
accompanied by Jemina Liverman.  

 
Ms. Collins was informed the case was dismissed. 

 
CONFERENCE  
SCHEDULED:  Sheli Hale, LPN      0002-063063 

Ms. Hale appeared. 
 

Ms. Hale was informed a recommended decision will be made and mailed to her 
within ninety days. 

 
This recommendation will be presented to the Board; if accepted, an Order will 
be entered. As provided by law, this decision shall become a Final Order thirty 
days after service of such order on Ms. Hale unless a written request to the 
Board for a formal hearing on the allegations made against her is received from 
Ms. Hale within such time. If service of the order is made by mail, three 
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additional days shall be added to that period. Upon such timely request for a 
formal hearing, the Order shall be vacated. 

  
 ADJOURNMENT:  The conference was concluded at 3:40 P.M.     
    
 
 

                      
_______________________________________ 
Robin L. Hills, D.N.P., R.N., W.H.N.P.-B.C.  
Deputy Executive Director for Advanced Practice 

        


